
Unveiling the Enchantment: Of Wind And Tide
by Erin Riha

Supernatural thrillers have always had a special place in the hearts of readers,
and Erin Riha's latest masterpiece, "Of Wind And Tide," effortlessly captures the
essence of this genre while weaving a mesmerizing tale that lingers with long-
lasting impact.
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"Of Wind And Tide" takes readers on an exhilarating journey through a world
where magic and darkness collide. With vivid descriptions and immersive
storytelling, Riha paints a captivating picture that blurs the lines between reality
and the supernatural, leaving readers spellbound from start to finish.
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Unmasking the Protagonist: Delilah McLeod

At the heart of this enthralling narrative is Delilah McLeod, a young woman with a
secret that could shatter her life as she knows it. Delilah must confront her fears
and embrace her hidden powers to confront the looming danger that threatens
not only herself but everything she holds dear.

Riha's character development is nothing short of exceptional. Delilah McLeod
comes to life with all her strengths and vulnerabilities, making her relatable and
endearing to readers. Her internal struggles and personal growth make her a
strong and inspiring lead, transforming "Of Wind And Tide" into an irresistible
page-turner.

Embracing an Enchanting Setting
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While the characters drive the narrative, the setting in "Of Wind And Tide" is just
as enchanting. Riha effortlessly transports readers to a world where supernatural
powers and ancient folklore coexist with everyday life. From the mist-laden woods
to the eerie whispers of the sea, every location in the novel is crafted with
remarkable detail.

The coastal town of Ravenbrook becomes a character in itself, as its rich history
and mystical aura play a significant role in shaping the events that unfold. This
attention to detail creates a powerful atmosphere that readers can immerse
themselves in, making the experience of reading "Of Wind And Tide" all the more
enthralling.

A Thrilling Blend of Mystery and Magic

Mystery looms large in "Of Wind And Tide" as Delilah finds herself entangled in a
web of secrets, betrayal, and unexpected alliances. Each chapter unravels a new
piece of the puzzle, fueling anticipation and leaving readers on the edge of their
seats.

Furthermore, the use of magic in the narrative adds an additional layer of intrigue.
Riha navigates the realm of supernatural elements with finesse, effortlessly
merging them into the storyline without overpowering the human aspect. This
delicate balance keeps readers hooked as they eagerly follow Delilah's journey,
desperate to uncover the truth.

An Unforgettable Supernatural Thriller

Readers who immerse themselves in Erin Riha's "Of Wind And Tide" will
undoubtedly be left breathless by its gripping plot, masterful character
development, and atmospheric setting. Riha's writing effortlessly combines



magic, mystery, and the human experience, resulting in a novel that will linger in
the minds of readers long after the final page.

If you're a fan of supernatural thrillers, "Of Wind And Tide" is a must-read. Join
Delilah McLeod on her extraordinary journey, where danger lurks around every
corner and secrets refuse to stay buried. Prepare to lose yourself in the
enchantment and get ready for a rollercoaster ride of emotions that will leave you
craving more.
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Arden Thatcher is on the run. Adrift in a sea of doubt.

Wanted for murder, pursued by bounty hunters, Arden and Beck flee into the
obscurity offered by the northernmost reaches of Nordania. The newspapers
make it seem as though Declan has moved on, and with the promises of global
change fading, Arden starts to wonder if she even wants to go back.

It’s only after Declan reappears, reaffirming her as his choice, that a new plan
evolves. But to clear her name, and Beck’s, she’ll need the support of the
institute’s alumni—the only women in Nordania with the power to vote. Only,

FREE

https://open-source-book-library.web.app/free-book.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6IllOa3BPUk8xQXR4akVtamFkeVkxbXJPcTBndkNxRTRyaHBiS2tsa3hNdnNoRVluRE9pME9OK1g0MGgyTGpIaWRLUm9YTHhlSWpKdG9weU9JXC90XC9oSm5TV0xEVWR0Q0tDTHVWTzNwVHh1QVN2RW5vWWFVM29BS1phcERMaElsZlZNNElkXC9QNzRnd1BUSFwvd3ZUWkkxN3c9PSIsIml2IjoiNjI2MWY1MTI4NGNkOWM0ZmRiOGJiMjE2MGZiYjg2YTAiLCJzIjoiNzdhZGE5NzdmYjQ3MGM4MyJ9
https://open-source-book-library.web.app/free-book.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6IkFcLzhzanYxazhVQ2J6XC9xMStUd0luaTJsajI4OGNoODBKOXlRQTkwMFA3dXRSbW9takxKcmRKSzdISWNyR3JHanA3WFpTXC9EcXllQ2dpZWY2TlwvN0VsRGFRTXZlOERJeGtsVW5XdDlrVkxyQXFrb3N5RHh3SjNLZkRSc0hBYzNLeEJORThqQlk3N2lIck5cL0Z2MGdEQVwvZz09IiwiaXYiOiJmYzM2ZjAyZDM5ZDBkMzViYmQ4MDRjZTA4NDRmOTc5YyIsInMiOiIzYzFkYzFlMWZmNTU3NDRhIn0%3D
https://open-source-book-library.web.app/free-book.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6IjhsVHdmM05kUnNzeFwvb3pGeSs1SkpuXC9DUUU4T3NzVmtVem9aWnhRV1Z1eVJUOTJzWlpRZVIrcXA1Z3RRTmZFN28weFpwd1wvSklrN2VFdXdcL0JESWhvdVRPdFU3RHZaVmFneXpuTzV6R0ZOb1JmTFRqXC9ZZ0NzbGxhZUk0RExzR0FMZFdaT3dmTnYyWjdIVHBnTXltSGpBPT0iLCJpdiI6IjdjYjQxNTEzZWQ1NGJiNTk3YWZlZTJhZjk2ZDdhYWRmIiwicyI6ImE3ODBiYzEwYTQzZDY1YjgifQ%3D%3D


they’re scattered like seeds in the wind, and only a small handful ever participate
in the role they’ve been given.

Determined to protect the freedom she’s fought so hard to earn, Arden is left with
a choice: stay in Beck’s world, hidden away, seen and appreciated in ways she’s
never had, or return to the institute, to Declan, and the chance to effect change
for Nordanian women everywhere.

What price would you pay, if changing the world was at stake?

Action-packed, poignant, and thrilling, Of Wind and Tide is the riveting sequel to
But For the Mountains and the second entry in the Embers in Wait Trilogy.
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