
The Great Crime of World War: Unveiling the
History of Terror
World War I and World War II left an indelible mark on our history. The horrors
witnessed during these devastating conflicts are well-documented, but one
aspect often overlooked is the dark underbelly of war – the crimes committed by
both sides. In this article, we delve deep into the shadows of history to unravel
the narrative of terror that unfolded during these tumultuous times.

The Prelude to Terror

Before we dive into the crimes that took place during the World Wars, it is
essential to understand the context in which they occurred. Nationalism, political
rivalries, and territorial disputes set the stage for the deadly conflicts that would
follow.

The Great War, as World War I was initially known, erupted in 1914. Almost
immediately, the battlefield became a hotbed for violence and inhumanity. With
advancements in technology, the destruction was unprecedented. But amidst the
chaos of battle, a different form of terror was quietly taking root – war crimes.
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Unleashing Hell upon Humanity

The scale of violence witnessed during World War I created an environment in
which war crimes thrived. From brutal mistreatment of prisoners of war to
deliberate targeting of civilians, atrocities became a part of daily life. The use of
chemical weapons added another horrifying dimension to the brutality.

One of the most infamous war crimes of this era was the Armenian Genocide.
The Ottoman Empire systematically exterminated its Armenian population,
resulting in the deaths of an estimated 1.5 million people. Mass executions,
forced deportations, and mass starvation left a scar on history that still provokes
debate and denial to this day.

The Rise of Nazi Atrocities

World War II brought with it a new wave of terror, spearheaded by the Nazi
regime in Germany. Adolf Hitler's vision of racial purity and Lebensraum (living
space) fueled an ideology that justified the most heinous crimes against
humanity.

The Holocaust, the systematic genocide of six million Jews, stands as a symbol
of the atrocities committed during this dark period. Concentration camps like
Auschwitz-Birkenau became notorious for their gas chambers and crematoria,
where innocent men, women, and children were ruthlessly murdered. Holocaust
deniers may attempt to distort the truth, but the evidence of this monstrous crime
is irrefutable.

Crimes Against POWs and Non-Combatants
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The mistreatment of prisoners of war and non-combatants has been a recurring
theme throughout history, but World War II witnessed some of the most depraved
acts of violence against these individuals. The Bataan Death March, for instance,
saw the brutal treatment of American and Filipino prisoners by Japanese soldiers.
Forced marches, rampant starvation, and deliberate killings resulted in the deaths
of thousands.

Another infamous example of crimes against non-combatants is the bombing of
Hiroshima and Nagasaki. The atomic bombs dropped by the United States
caused widespread death and destruction, with estimates putting the number of
casualties at over 200,000. The decision to use these devastating weapons has
long been a subject of debate and controversy.

Learning from the Past

Reflecting on the atrocities committed during the World Wars can be a sobering
experience. It serves as a reminder of the depths to which humanity can sink
when consumed by anger, hatred, and fear. However, it also provides an
opportunity for growth and learning.

By understanding the true history of terror, we can ensure that such crimes are
never repeated. Education, remembrance, and promoting tolerance are essential
in fostering a society that values peace and rejects violence. It is through these
efforts that we can truly honor the memory of those who suffered and lost their
lives during these dark periods.

The Great Crime of World War remains as an everlasting testament to the worst
aspects of humanity. From the calculated genocide of the Armenian people to the
systemic annihilation of millions of Jews during the Holocaust, these events stand
as a stark reminder of the depths to which human beings can descend. It is



essential that we remember and learn from these dark chapters of history,
ensuring that we never forget the victims and do everything in our power to
prevent such crimes from happening again.
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A moving, gripping short history of the "forgotten genocide", told through the
stories of those who witnessed it.

Crammed into cattle trucks and deported to camps, shot and buried in mass
graves, or force-marched to death: over 1.5 million Armenians were murdered by
the Turkish state, twenty years before the start of Hitler's Holocaust. It was
described as a crime against humanity and Turkey was condemned by Russia,
France, Great Britain and the United States. But two decades later the genocide
had been conveniently forgotten. Hitler justified his Polish death squads by asking
in 1939: 'Who after all is today speaking about the destruction of the Armenians?'

Armenian Genocide is a new, gripping short history that tells the story of a
forgotten genocide: the men and women who died, the few who survived, and the
diplomats who tried to intervene. 
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