
Social Media in Iran Politics and Society After
2009
In recent years, the role of social media in shaping politics and society has
become increasingly evident across the globe. This is especially true in the case
of Iran, where the use of social media platforms has significantly influenced the
country's political landscape and social dynamics since the 2009 presidential
election.

After the disputed election results in 2009, which sparked widespread protests,
Iranians turned to social media platforms such as Twitter, Facebook, and
YouTube to express their grievances, share information, and organize
demonstrations. This marked a significant shift from traditional forms of activism
and communication, as the Iranian government had strict control over
mainstream media outlets.

One key aspect that contributed to the growth of social media in Iran's political
landscape is the country's young and tech-savvy population. Iran has one of the
highest internet penetration rates in the Middle East, with a large percentage of
its population being active internet users. This tech-savvy population quickly
adapted to using social media platforms as a means of communication and
expression.
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The widespread use of social media during the 2009 protests helped amplify the
voices of Iranians who felt marginalized and oppressed. Information and images
that would have otherwise been suppressed by the government were quickly
shared and disseminated, reaching a global audience. This exposure had a
significant impact on international perceptions of the Iranian government's
handling of the protests.

Furthermore, social media enabled Iranians to connect with like-minded
individuals and form virtual communities centered around shared interests and
causes. Political discussions, organizational efforts, and the dissemination of
information took place on these platforms, allowing for a more coordinated and
decentralized resistance movement.

However, the Iranian government soon recognized the power of social media and
began implementing strict measures to control its influence. The authorities
imposed internet censorship, blocked access to popular social media platforms,
and employed a cyber army to monitor and suppress online dissent. Despite
these efforts, Iranians continue to find ways to bypass these restrictions through
the use of VPNs and other anonymity tools.

FREE

https://open-source-book-library.web.app/free-book.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6IjVtNDhUVVE4bWJBNkVrT2pyWnArNlVNeU9ia3owRlo1Q1EwaHRrQ3U2cWVzcGtRc1VPaFIzNU15M2RuN0FCWVBTN0JoYVZ1ZUU2ckphZVN3bkhHdG04eWVnV0Q0TklqMEQwR1hyY0llU3M0ZUlKSDNrZGlYS2ZseEpFcUpuK2lHU3B4UVwvcEQwZzVyeGxmbUJQaHFWTE1iWWc0SnBKWVpQbkc1MmhwaDNleHRVWnVscFdlRjVTaWFmUVhKNDhrTzQiLCJpdiI6IjllOGRlNThhOTYyNmJkN2Q0NjQ4YTg2NTU2ZjM0MDA1IiwicyI6IjFmYWE5YzNlZWE4MjljMDEifQ%3D%3D
https://open-source-book-library.web.app/free-book.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6InkySlRDMTludHhhR2ZPMUs2dEJ6a0g4cHdkZ0VBMksxcmd6THlQcXdoMldvcEJselwvajd2ZURcLzUySmR0S3ZqOFp2Q2I3Q3FyYlRkUGIyUlJnMW91Z1ZqSGtlOWdyS2Y5aWlJQzZYTjc5YWdXT05NRlwvTGEwNXpRc0w4K1hidFlqWEpSY0dcL0hDcjJYMTdpV25MVmZYeGdrWDRpeU9Wa09MNFJFVHZWU0E2WHZMeENEVEZjYkJUdHpQZjNLVmhRakciLCJpdiI6Ijc5MDNiM2ZlMDY0MTdhYTY0Y2U5M2JlZGQyNTkyZWJmIiwicyI6IjExNDM4ZTliY2EyOTM5YzQifQ%3D%3D


Another notable development was the rise of digital activism as a powerful tool for
change in Iran. Online platforms served as a catalyst for mobilizing various social
and political movements, including women's rights, human rights, and LGBTQ+
rights. Digital activism allowed marginalized groups to voice their concerns and
campaign for their rights, both within and outside of Iran.

Furthermore, social media platforms played a crucial role in exposing corruption
and shedding light on human rights violations, contributing to a more informed
public opinion. Videos and images shared through social media have played a
significant role in revealing incidents of police brutality and other forms of abuse
by the Iranian authorities.

While social media has undoubtedly played a role in shaping Iran's politics and
society, it is important to note that it is not a panacea. It has its limitations and
challenges. The spread of misinformation and propaganda is a persistent issue,
as various actors, both domestic and foreign, attempt to manipulate public
opinion through social media platforms. The Iranian government has also
intensified its efforts to crack down on online dissent, resulting in the arrest and
imprisonment of individuals for their online activities.

Despite these challenges, social media continues to serve as a powerful tool for
Iranians to express their concerns, connect with others, and mobilize for change.
It has become an integral part of the country's political and social landscape,
providing a platform for voices that would otherwise be silenced and
marginalized.

, the of social media in Iran's political and social spheres after the 2009 protests
has had a profound impact. It has empowered Iranians to challenge the status
quo, express their grievances, and connect with like-minded individuals. While
the Iranian government has attempted to control and suppress the influence of



social media, it remains an essential tool for activism and societal change. As
technology continues to evolve, the role of social media in Iran's politics and
society will continue to evolve as well.
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Social Media in Iran is the first book to tell the complex story of how and why the
Iranian people—including women, homosexuals, dissidents, artists, and even
state actors—use social media technology, and in doing so create a contentious
environment wherein new identities and realities are constructed. Drawing
together emerging and established scholars in communication, culture, and
media studies, this volume considers the role of social media in Iranian society,
particularly the time during and after the controversial 2009 presidential election,
a watershed moment in the postrevolutionary history of Iran. While regional
specialists may find studies on specific themes useful, the aim of this volume is to
provide broad narratives of actor-based conceptions of media technology, an
approach that focuses on the experiential and social networking processes of
digital practices in the information era extended beyond cultural specificities.
Students and scholars of regional and media studies will find this volume rich with
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empirical and theoretical insights on the subject of how technologies shape
political and everyday life.
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